
Welcome back to a fantastic start of the school year. It was lovely 
to see you all return after the summer holidays. 

It has been a delight to see our children return to school in full  
uniform and with such a positive attitude for school and learning.  

Over the course of last year, the school entered a lengthy         
tendering process for the school’s cleaning contract and ended 
the contract with the previous provider at the end of the summer 
term. It is clear that over the course of this process the standard of 
cleaning significantly reduced to that of unsatisfactory. This term 
we entered a new contract with a new provider, who conducted a 
deep clean of the school over the summer. We have also changed 
our arrangements to a morning clean to support monitoring       
arrangements and ensure the school is freshly cleaned for the day 
ahead. 

 

Over the Summer Holiday we had borders fitted to our front      
garden beds. Please ensure children do not run within these, in 
order to reduce the likelihood of them standing on the borders. I 
appreciate your support in the maintenance of this improvement. 

 

Thank you to all parent volunteers who kept our Edible Garden 
well watered over the holidays, our vegetables would not have 
survived without you. 

 

In order to allow easier access for parents and reduce waste we 
have  relocated our lost property box to under the shelter outside 
the music suite. Pupils and parents will be able to access the box 
to retrieve lost items before and after school. 

This term we say good bye to Mr Greaves, our Sports Coach. We 
would like to thank him for all his work and wish him well for the 
future. In the short term all areas of Sport will be covered whilst 
we confirm our  recruitment arrangements for a new Coach. 

                 Ms A. Parker 

Headteacher 

Secondary Transfer Meeting 
We will be hosting our Secondary Transfer 

meeting on Thursday 7th September at 

4pm, for our year 4 and 5 parents. At the 

meeting Ms McIntosh will explain the     

process, answering any questions you may 

have. We have also invited our local     

Secondary School to come along and 

share information about their schools. 

 

KS1 Eid Assembly  

Thursday 7th September at 2.45pm in the KS1 Hall, we look forward to seeing you there! 

Tuesday 5th September 2017 

Dates for the diary 

Yr6 Residential Blacklands Farm 

Monday, 11th - Thursday 14th September 

Well-being Week 

Monday, 18th - Friday 22nd September 

Jeans for Jeans/Road Closure  

Friday 22nd September 

Poetry Day 

Thursday 28th September 

End of Half Term  

Friday 20th October, 3.15pm 

INSET Day  

Monday 30th October 

Return 

Tuesday 31st October  

For more information visit our website  

www.bonneville-primary.lambeth.sch.uk 

 

This months value is Co-operation  



Dinner Money 

This half term £84.00 

Next half term £86.40 

Look out for the full Autumn Term 

Calendar Out Next Week! 

Being ready for learning! 

Please ensure your child attends school in the correct 

school uniform (visit the school website for details) and is 

well equipped for the day with PE kit, packed lunch (if ap-

propriate) homework and reading book.  

All children should attend school with hardwearing robust 

footwear suitable for playtimes as there are no                

opportunities for them to change footwear during the school 

day. 

25th September 

Clubs Start! 

Look out for your booking form 
this week.  

Reception Parents 

Remember  to come 

along to Forest Friday! 

Reception children having fun on their  

second day of school 

Local Trips Sometimes it is necessary for us to take the children on local trips, this can vary from visiting 

the post Office or going to the common for outdoor learning or sport activities. As these destinations are     

familiar to us, the usual risk assessment are in place to make these visits safe .Therefore we do not seek      

permission for these local trips but you will be informed when they happen. Requests for local trips will always 

be made to The Leadership Team of the school. 

Extended Services 

3.15 to 4.15 provision 

Clubs: Clubs will begin week commencing Monday 

25th September and run for 10 weeks. Please ensure 

you return your booking form on time. 

Reading Café (8am to 9am): First come first serve 

basis 

Carry on Café (3.15pm to 6pm): First come first 

serve basis 

Parental Responsibility 

If you are a non-resident parent with parental responsibility 
please ensure you provide the administrative team with your   
contact details. For further information please read our Parental 
Responsibility policy, which can be found on the schools website. 

What we really mean! 

UKS2-Upper Key Stage 2         

Years 5 and 6 

LKS2- Lower Key Stage 2         

Years 3 and 4 

KS1- Key Stage 2                   

Years 1 and 2 

EYFS- Early Years Foundation Stage                            

Nursery and Reception 

National Poetry 

Day and Book Fair! 

28th September in the 

KS1 Hall 

A variety of pupil leadership opportunities will be advertised 

soon from Well– being Mentors to Language and Digital 

Leaders, Student Councillors and Eco-Warriors. 


